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SALOMON

SOCKS -RUNNING

ULTRA GLIDE ANKLE
LC2164500
WHITE/PEARL BLUE/Bering Sea

ULTRA GLIDE ANKLE
LC2164700
BLACK/HIGH RISK RED/Zinnia

ULTRA GLIDE ANKLE
LC2255300
BLACK/Phantom/GHOST GRAY
16-4703 TCX

AERO CREW
LC2080500
BLACK/EBONY/PEARL BLUE

AERO CREW
LC2080600
WHITE/Quarry/Quiet Shade

AERO CREW
LC2256400
BLACK/GRISAILLE/QUIET SHADE

Temperature regulating, friction-
reducing ultra distance socks.

Temperature regulating, friction-
reducing ultra distance socks.

Temperature regulating, friction-
reducing ultra distance socks.

All the right features in all the
right places, your go-to for daily
runs.

All the right features in all the
right places, your go-to for daily
runs.

All the right features in all the
right places, your go-to for daily
runs.

AERO ANKLE
LC2080900
BLACK/EBONY/PEARL BLUE

AERO ANKLE
LC2081000
WHITE/Quarry/Quiet Shade

AERO ANKLE
LC2256500
BLACK/GRISAILLE/GHOST GRAY
16-4703 TCX

AERO ANKLE
LC2256600
ALFALFA/SUNNY LIME/GHOST
GRAY 16-4703 TCX

PULSE ANKLE
LC2165900
BLACK/Monument/Magnet

PULSE ANKLE
LC2255700
Shark Skin/Glacier Gray/WHITE

All the right features in all the
right places, your go-to for daily
runs.

All the right features in all the
right places, your go-to for daily
runs.

All the right features in all the
right places, your go-to for daily
runs.

All the right features in all the
right places, your go-to for daily
runs.

The ankle sock ready to perform The ankle sock ready to perform

PULSE ANKLE
LC2255800
Surf The Web/CARBON/WHITE

PULSE ANKLE
LC2255900
BLACK/Sulphur
Spring/TRANSPARENT YELLOW

PULSE CREW
LC2165600
BLACK/Monument/Magnet

PULSE CREW
LC2255400
Shark Skin/Glacier Gray/WHITE

PULSE CREW
LC2255500
Surf The Web/CARBON/WHITE

The ankle sock ready to perform The ankle sock ready to perform The crew sock ready to perform The crew sock ready to perform The crew sock ready to perform

PULSE CREW
LC2255600
BLACK/Sulphur
Spring/TRANSPARENT YELLOW

SPEEDCROSS CREW
LC2164800
BLACK/Magnet/Quarry

SPEEDCROSS CREW
LC2164900
FRENCH BLUE/CARBON/IBIZA
BLUE

SPEEDCROSS CREW
LC2165000
WHITE/LIGHT GREY MELANGE
B1004/Light Grey.

SPEEDCROSS CREW
LC2256200
India Ink/BLACK/DRIED HERB

The crew sock ready to perform A sock trained for arduous
weather conditions.

A sock trained for arduous
weather conditions.

A sock trained for arduous
weather conditions.

A sock trained for arduous
weather conditions.

SPEEDCROSS ANKLE
LC2165100
BLACK/Magnet/Quarry
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SPEEDCROSS ANKLE
LC2165200
FRENCH BLUE/CARBON/IBIZA
BLUE

SPEEDCROSS ANKLE
LC2165300
RED DAHLIA/BLACK/Poppy Red-X

SPEEDCROSS ANKLE
LC2165400
WHITE/LIGHT GREY MELANGE
B1004/Light Grey.

SPEEDCROSS ANKLE
LC2256300
India Ink/BLACK/DRIED HERB

ULTRA GLIDE CREW
LC2164200
WHITE/PEARL BLUE/Bering Sea

A sock trained for arduous
weather conditions.

A sock trained for arduous
weather conditions.

A sock trained for arduous
weather conditions.

A sock trained for arduous
weather conditions.

A sock trained for arduous
weather conditions.

Temperature regulating, friction-
reducing ultra distance socks.

¥2,530 including Tax
¥1,980 including Tax

¥1,650 including Tax

¥2,530 including Tax

¥2,530 including Tax ¥2,750 including Tax

¥2,750 including Tax ¥2,530 including Tax

¥2,200 including Tax ¥2,750 including Tax



ULTRA GLIDE CREW
LC2164400
BLACK/HIGH RISK RED/Zinnia

ULTRA GLIDE CREW
LC2255200
BLACK/Phantom/GHOST GRAY
16-4703 TCX

GALAXY PULSE
LC2258900
WHITE/Surf The Web/DRAGON
FIRE

PULSE RACE FLAG CREW
LC2262100
BLACK/Bright Red/LEMON

PULSE RACE FLAG CREW
LC2262200
WHITE/Bright Red/LEMON

Temperature regulating, friction-
reducing ultra distance socks.

Temperature regulating, friction-
reducing ultra distance socks.

Socks for extra energy and
infinite motivation on your next
run.

Super precise foot-hugging hold
that’s ready to race.

Super precise foot-hugging hold
that’s ready to race.

SOCKS -OUTDOOR

X ULTRA ACCESS QUARTER 2-
LC2082900
Anthracite/BLACK

X ULTRA ACCESS QUARTER 2-
LC2166200
Quarry/STARGAZER/STERLING
BLUE

X ULTRA ACCESS QUARTER 2-
LC2257000
BLEACHED SAND/BLACK

X ULTRA ACCESS CREW 2-PAC
LC2083200
Anthracite/BLACK

X ULTRA ACCESS CREW 2-PAC
LC2166100
Quarry/STARGAZER

X ULTRA ACCESS CREW 2-PAC
LC2256800
BLEACHED SAND/BLACK

A merino blend sock designed for
long hikes and adventures in the
wild.

A merino blend sock designed for
long hikes and adventures in the
wild.

A merino blend sock designed for
long hikes and adventures in the
wild.

A merino blend sock designed for
long hikes and adventures in the
wild.

A merino blend sock designed for
long hikes and adventures in the
wild.

A merino blend sock designed for
long hikes and adventures in the
wild.

X ULTRA ACCESS CREW 2-PAC
LC2256900
RAINY DAY/Laurel Wreath

X ULTRA QUARTER
LC2166600
BLACK/Kelp

X ULTRA QUARTER
LC2166700
Peat/DEEP LICHEN GREEN/Kelp

X ULTRA QUARTER
LC2166800
CARBON/STARGAZER/PEARL
BLUE

X ULTRA CREW
LC2166300
BLACK/Kelp

A merino blend sock designed for
long hikes and adventures in the
wild.

Hiking socks geared up for all-
conditions adventures.

Hiking socks geared up for all-
conditions adventures.

Hiking socks geared up for all-
conditions adventures.

Hiking socks geared up for all-
conditions adventures.

X ULTRA CREW
LC2166400
Peat/DEEP LICHEN GREEN/Kelp

X ULTRA CREW
LC2166500
CARBON/STARGAZER/PEARL
BLUE

OUT ALPS CREW 2-PACK
LC2261400
CARBON/BRONZE BROWN

OUT ALPS CREW 2-PACK
LC2261500
Curry/SHORTBREAD

Hiking socks geared up for all-
conditions adventures.

Hiking socks geared up for all-
conditions adventures.

Soft, comfortable foot-huggers
designed for everyday
adventures.

Soft, comfortable foot-huggers
designed for everyday
adventures.

SOCKS -EVERYDAY

EVERYDAY ANKLE 3-PACK
LC2086500
WHITE/WHITE/WHITE

SALOMON Footwear and Gear SS24 EN id:1577 v:85 |PER_ALL |28-May-2023 21:51 Page 3

EVERYDAY ANKLE 3-PACK
LC2086600
BLACK/BLACK/BLACK

EVERYDAY ANKLE 3-PACK
LC2086700
BLACK/WHITE/MED GREY
MELANGE

EVERYDAY ANKLE 3-PACK
LC2169600
Vanilla Ice/METAL/HAZELNUT

EVERYDAY ANKLE 3-PACK
LC2258800
CARBON/Falcon/MOONSCAPE

EVERYDAY CREW 3-PACK
LC2086000
WHITE/WHITE/WHITE

Classic cotton blend ankle sock
for comfortable daily wear.

Classic cotton blend ankle sock
for comfortable daily wear.

Classic cotton blend ankle sock
for comfortable daily wear.

Classic cotton blend ankle sock
for comfortable daily wear.

Classic cotton blend ankle sock
for comfortable daily wear.

Classic cottonblend crew for
comfortable daily wear.

¥2,750 including Tax ¥2,750 including Tax ¥3,080 including Tax

¥2,860 including Tax ¥3,190 including Tax

¥3,190 including Tax
¥2,420 including Tax

¥2,750 including Tax

¥2,750 including Tax

¥2,420 including Tax

¥1,430 including Tax ¥1,650 including Tax



EVERYDAY CREW 3-PACK
LC2086100
BLACK/BLACK/BLACK

EVERYDAY CREW 3-PACK
LC2086200
BLACK/WHITE/MED GREY
MELANGE

EVERYDAY CREW 3-PACK
LC2169500
Vanilla Ice/METAL/HAZELNUT

EVERYDAY CREW 3-PACK
LC2258600
CARBON/GHOST GRAY 16-4703
TCX/ARONA

EVERYDAY CREW 3-PACK
LC2258700
CARBON/GHOST GRAY 16-4703
TCX/Sulphur Spring

SUNDAY SMART ANKLE
LC2168800
BLACK/Gray Flannel

Classic cottonblend crew for
comfortable daily wear.

Classic cottonblend crew for
comfortable daily wear.

Classic cottonblend crew for
comfortable daily wear.

Classic cottonblend crew for
comfortable daily wear.

Classic cottonblend crew for
comfortable daily wear.

A thin merino-blend sock for that
everydayVIP treatment.

SUNDAY SMART ANKLE
LC2168900
SNOW/BLACK

SUNDAY SMART ANKLE
LC2257900
Shark Skin/BLACK

365 CREW
LC2085200
BLACK/WHITE

365 CREW
LC2085400
WHITE/BLACK

365 CREW
LC2169200
NATURAL/BLACK

365 CREW
LC2258300
ARONA/BLACK

A thin merino-blend sock for that
everydayVIP treatment.

A thin merino-blend sock for that
everydayVIP treatment.

Soft nylon blend crew for
comfortable daily wear.

Soft nylon blend crew for
comfortable daily wear.

Soft nylon blend crew for
comfortable daily wear.

Soft nylon blend crew for
comfortable daily wear.

365 CREW
LC2258400
SUNNY LIME/BLACK

365 CREW
LC2258500
ORCHID PETAL/BLACK

SUNDAY SMART CREW
LC2163300
BLACK/Gray Flannel

SUNDAY SMART CREW
LC2163400
SNOW/BLACK

SUNDAY SMART CREW
LC2257800
Shark Skin/BLACK

EVERYDAY LOW 3-PACK
LC2086900
WHITE/WHITE/WHITE

Soft nylon blend crew for
comfortable daily wear.

Soft nylon blend crew for
comfortable daily wear.

A thin merino-blend sock for that
everydayVIP treatment.

A thin merino-blend sock for that
everydayVIP treatment.

A thin merino-blend sock for that
everydayVIP treatment.

Classic cottonblend sock for
comfortable daily wear.

EVERYDAY LOW 3-PACK
LC2087000
BLACK/BLACK/BLACK

SALOMON Footwear and Gear SS24 EN id:1577 v:85 |PER_ALL |28-May-2023 21:51 Page 4

EVERYDAY LOW 3-PACK
LC2087100
BLACK/WHITE/MED GREY
MELANGE

CREAMY LAVA CREW
LC2258000
Phantom

CREAMY LAVA CREW
LC2258100
CORK

CREAMY LAVA CREW
LC2258200
SUGAR CORAL

Classic cottonblend sock for
comfortable daily wear.

Classic cottonblend sock for
comfortable daily wear.

Mood-elevating graphics and silk-
like comfort.

Mood-elevating graphics and silk-
like comfort.

Mood-elevating graphics and silk-
like comfort.

¥1,650 including Tax ¥3,520 including Tax

¥3,520 including Tax ¥1,650 including Tax

¥1,650 including Tax ¥3,960 including Tax ¥1,320 including Tax

¥1,320 including Tax ¥1,650 including Tax
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